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S uppose after a long-term in­
vestigation involving por­
nographic material that of­

ficers lawfully seize virtually the 
entire inventory of a local news 
store because these publications fit 
within the judicially accepted defi­
nition of pornography. Also assume 
that the policy of the prosecutor's 
office concerning the prosecution of 
pornography cases subsequently 
changes. 

The prosecutor's office then in­
forms the police department that it 
does not have the time or resources 
to prosecute the pornography case. 
The investigating officers believe 
that the owner of the news store is 

likely to file a civil lawsuit against 
them and their employer, seeking 
money damages for the seizure of 
the materials. In such a case, can the 
officers appropriately request that 
the prosecutor attempt to get an 
agreement from the store owner re­
leasing all civil claims that he might 
have as a result of the investigation 
and seizure in exchange for the 
government's dismissal of the case? 

This article discusses the en­
forceability of these agreements, 
called "release-dismissal agree­
ments," wherein a suspect or de­
fendant agrees not to bring a civil 
suit concerning police investigative 
activity in exchange for the govern-

ment agreeing to dismiss charges, 
not bring criminal charges, or re­
duce charges. The article also exam­
ines recent case rulings on release­
dismissal agreements and offers 
some practical advice to police re­
garding their use. 

THE SUPREME COURT 
RULE 

Prior to 1987, courts generally 
disagreed on whether release-dis­
missal agreements were always 
against public policy, and thus, 
unenforceable. I However, in its 
1987 decision in Town of Newton v. 
Rumery? the U.S. Supreme Court 
upheld the enforceability of a 
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release-dismissal agreement, find­
ing that the agreement was voluntar­
ily entered into and was not against 
the public interest. 

Factual Background 
The case arose out of an indict­

ment of David Champy for sexual 
ussault. A friend of Champy' s, Ber­
nard Rumery, read about the indict­
ment in a local newspaper and tele­
phoned the alleged victim, who was 
acquainted with both Rumery and 
Champy. After the call, the victim 
reported to police that Rumery tried 
to force her to drop the charges and 
threatened her if she did not. 

Rumery claimed he only ad­
vised her th&t she did not have to go 
forward with the sexual assault 
charges against Champy if she did 
not want to. After a second call be­
tween Rumery and the alleged vic­
tim, police obtained an arrest war­
rant and arrested Rumery for 
tampering with a witness. 

Special Agent McCormack is a legal 
instructor at the FBI Academy. 

" 

... -" 

"'- . 

Rumery subsequently hired an 
attorney, who contacted the pros­
ecutor about the charges. Rumery's 
attorney and the prosecutor eventu­
ally reached an agreement, unrler 
which the prosecutor would dismiss 
the charges agdnst Rumery if he 
would agree no ;-} :me for any harm 
caused by the arrest. Rumery's at­
torney then drafted the written 
agreement and discussed it with 
Rumery, who thought about it for 3 
days and then signed it. The crimi­
nal charges were then dropped. 

Ten months later, Rumery filed 
a civil action, alleging constitu­
tional violations under 42 U.S.C. 
§1983 and State common law 
claims as a result of his arrest for the 
witness-tampering charges. The de­
fendants in the civil suit filed a mo­
tion to dismiss the civil suit, relying 
on the release-dismissal agreement 
as an affirmative defense. 

The district court found that 
Rumery voluntarily and intelli-

Courts ... have upheld 
the enforceability of 
[release-dismissal] 
agreements that are 
in the public interest 

and voluntary. 

" 

gently signed the agreement and 
dismissed his lawsuit. Rumery ap­
pealed to the U.S. Court of Appeals 
for the First Circuit, which reversed 
the district court and held that re­
lease-dismissal agreements were 
per se invalid. 

The U.s, Supreme Court re­
versed the appellate court's deci­
sion. The Court concluded that 
while some release-dismissal agree­
ments may infringe important inter­
ests of a criminal defendant or of 
society as a whole, the mere possi­
bility of harm to these interests does 
not justify a per se rule that all such 
agreements are invalid.3 

Public Interests Served 
The Court found that release­

dismissal agreements can further 
several significant public interests. 
First, they can discourage meritless 
or frivolous lawsuits against law en­
forcement officers and their em­
ployers. The Court noted that even 
frivolous or marginal civil suits re­
quire the time and attention of de­
fendant officials to the detriment of 
their public duties.4 Second, pros­
ecutors may have independent and 
legitimate reasons for dismissing 
charges related to government en­
forcement priorities or the relative 
strength of a particular case. Third, 
prosecutors need flexibility to de­
cide how to allocate the scarce re­
sources of a criminal justice system 
that cannot accommodate the litiga­
tion of every serious criminal 
charge.5 

The Court recognized that re­
lease-dismissal agreements might 
"tempt prosecutors to trump up 
charges in reaction to a defendant's 
ci viI rights claim, suppress evidence 
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of police misconduct, and leave 
unremedied deprivations of consti­
tutional rights." It concluded, how­
ever, that a per se rule of invalidity 
" ... fails to credit other relevant pub­
lic interests and improperly assumes 
prosecutorial misconduct."6 

The Court found that the pros­
ecutor in Rumery had a legitimate 
reason to make this agreement di­
rectly related to his prosecutorial 
responsibilities. The agreement 
prevented both a civil and criminal 
trial concerning Rumery, which 
spared the alleged sexual assault 
victim the public embarassment of 
having to testify in either of those 
trials.? 

All Agreements Not Inherently 
Coercive 

Rumery also argued that re­
lease-dismissal agreements are in­
herently coercive, and thus, invol­
untary and unenforceable. The 
Court agreed that some release-dis­
missal agreements may be involun­
tary, but rejected Rumery's argu­
ment that this possibility justified 
invalidating all such agreements.s 

The Court stated that "[I]n 
many cases a defendant's choice to 
enter into a release-dismissal agree­
ment will reflect a highly rational 
judgment that the certain benefits of 
escaping criminal prosecution ex­
ceed the speculative benefits of pre­
vailing in a civil action."9 In finding 
that Rumery's decision to sign the 
agreement was voluntary, the Court 
noted that (1) he was a sophisticated 
businessman; (2) he was not in jail 
and was represented by an experi­
enced criminal lawyer; (3) he con­
sidered the agreement for 3 days 

.. . 

before signing it; and (4) the benefit 
to him included immunity from 
criminal prosecution. 

The Court concluded the agree­
ment made between Rumery and the 
prosecutor was enforceable since it 
was voluntary, there was no evi­
dence of prosecutorial misconduct, 
and the enforcement of the agree­
ment would not adversely affect the 
relevant public interests. lo Finally, 
the Court suggested that it would be 
helpful, although not essential, to 

" 

Berry had been severely burned 
on his legs and arms after his non­
fire retardant foam mattress caught 
fire. Eight months later, Berry en­
tered into a covenant not to sue the 
county or its employees for dam­
ages and medical expenses arising 
from the fire. In exchange, the 
county agreed to pay his medical 
expenses, to drop arson charges 
against him based on the jail fire, 
and to recommend probation for 
four pending felony offenses. Nev-

.. .Iaw enforcement officers [should] always 
have the prosecutor negotiate and enter into 

a release-dismissal agreement. 

conclude release-dismissal agree­
ments under judicial supervision. I I 

COURTS ENFORCE 
VOLUNTARY AGREEMENTS 
IN THE PUBLIC INTEREST 

Berry v. Peterson 
Courts construing release-dis­

mi~sal agreements since Rumery 
have upheld the enforceability of 
agreements that are in the public 
interest and voluntary.12 For ex­
ample, the U.S. Court of Appeals 
for the Fifth Circuit upheld a re­
lease-dismissal agreement in Berry 
v. Peterson l3 and overturned a 
$200,000 jury verdict awarded to 
Berry, a jail inmate burned in a jail 
fire. 

" 
ertheless, Berry brought suit for his 
fire-related injuries, alleging consti­
tutional violations under 42 U.S.C. 
§ 1983 and common law tort claims 
and was awarded a $200,000 ver­
dict. 14 

The U.S. Court of Appeals for 
the Fifth Circuit reversed the ver­
dict. It offered three justifications 
for finding the ag10ement not to sue 
enforceable against Berry. 

First, the court said the 
voluntariness of the agreement was 
supported by the fact that an experi­
enced attorney represented Berry. 
The attorney discussed Berry's 
pending criminal charges and the 
agreement not to sue with Berry's 
other criminal defense attorneys. 
Also, there was no evidence that 
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anyone coerced Berry or his family 
into the agreement. 15 

Second, the court found no evi­
dence that the prosecutor inflated, 
mishandled, or trumped up the seri­
ous charges pending against Berry 
when he signed the agreement. Nor 
did the court find evidence that he 
had engaged in prosecutiorial over­
reaching. 16 

Third, the court determined that 
the public interest wlluld be served 
by enforcing the agreement. Berry 
received various benefits from the 
county as part of the agreement, 
including payment of his medical 
expenses, assistance from the 
county in his potential claim against 
the mattress manufacturer in a 
products liability suit, and a recom­
mendation from the pros­

~. .- .. 

in exchange for the plaintiff's 
waiver of the right to sue her father­
in-Iaw. 19 The plaintiff entered into 
this agreement but later brought suit 
under 42 U.S.C. §1983 against the 
prosecutor and her father-in-law. 
The district court entered a sum­
mary judgment for the defendants, 
and the U.S. Court of Appeals for 
the 10th Circuit affirmed that deci­
sion. 

The court stated that release­
dismissal agreements should be ex­
amined on a case-by-case basis and 
found four reasons to enforce the 
agreement against the plaintiff. 
First, evidence demonstrated that 
the parties involved voluntarily en­
tered into the agreement. The 

ecutor for probation on his ~---'+~~ 
pending felony charges. 
The court found the 
county likewise benefit­
ed from the agreement 
without forsaking its re­
sponsibility to Berry or its 
citizens. 17 

Hammond v. Bales 
The U.S. Court of Appeals 

for the 10th Circuit in Hammond v. 
Bales18 also upheld a release-dis­
missal agreement. In the case, the 
plaintiff allegedly entered her fa­
ther-in-law's home during the 
course of her marriage dissolution 
and removed items belonging to her 
father-in-law, who subsequently 
initiated criminal charges against 
her. 

Following a probable cause 
hearing at which plaintiff was 
bound over for trial, the prosecutor 
agreed to dismiss the criminal case 

plaintiff's defense attorney ap­
proached the prosecutor about drop­
ping the charges, and the defense 
attorney drafted the agreement after 
conSUlting with the plaintiff. 

Second, legitimate reasons ex­
isted for the prosecutor to enter into 
this agreement. Primarily, a large 
number of cases overloaded the jury 
docket, many of which warranted 
more immediate and serious con-

cern. Also, the prosecutor properly 
weighed the costs of a criminal pros­
ecution, the probability of success, 
and the number of witnesses who 
would have to be called, many of 
whom were government employ­
ees. 20 

Third, there was no evidence 
that the State created a frivolous 
criminal charge to suppress a valid 
civil complaint. And last, the parties 
executed the agreement under judi­
cial supervision.21 

PROSECUTORIAL 
IMMUNITY 

Courts have unanimously held 
that prosecutors are entitled to abso­
lute immunity for their part in en­

tering into release-dismissal 
agreements. 22 In Hammond, 

the court granted the defend­
ant-prosecutor absolute im­
munity for his decision to 
enter into the agreement. 
Courts consider a prose­
cutor's negotiations sur-
rounding release-dismissal 
agreements to be a prose­
cutorial function similar to 

plea bargaining, which is 
accorded absolute immunity 

from civil suits under Burns v. 
Reed 23 and Imbler v. Pachtman.24 

Courts, however, do not afford 
law enforcement officers absolute 
immunity. It is, therefore, very 
important that law enforcement of­
ficers always have the prosecutor 
negotiate and enter into a release­
dismissal agreement. If an agree­
ment or the decision to enter into the 
agreement is later challenged, the 
prosecutor will be granted absolute 
immunity from any potential civil 
claims arising out of the agreement. 



LIMITED ROLE FOR 
OFFICERS 

While it may be appropriate for 
a law enforcement officer to ask a 
prosecutor to consider the possibil­
ity of a release-dismissal agreement 
in a particular case, the prosecutor 
should always make the decision 
and conduct the negotiations. If of­
ficers assume the responsibility for 
entering into a release-dismissal 
agreement or attempt to get a waiver 
of potential civil claims in exchange 
for releasing an arrestee, such an 
agreement is not likely to be viewed 
as voluntary by the courts.25 The 
officer's attempts to get the waiver 
may also be viewed as a constitu­
tional tort in the nature of a first 
amendment violation for retaliatory 
prosecution.26 

LIMITED ENFORCEABILITY 
FOR CRIMES AGAINST 
OFFICERS 

The enforceability of release­
dismissal agreements is more lim­
ited where the charges brought 
against the arrestee involve a police 
officer.27 Courts recognize an in­
creased potential for abuse where 
release-dismissal agreements are 
used in cases involving crimes 
against the police, such as disor­
derly conduct, assault on a police 
officer, or resisting arrest. This is 
because there are often no inde­
pendent witnesses of the event 
forming the basis for the charge and 
the objectivity of the police in such 
cases may be impaired.28 

For example, where officers 
have used excessive force, they may 
have an incentive to arrest on a mar­
ginal or nonexistent violation, push 
for criminal charges, and then re-

-----------

quest a release-dismissal agree­
ment. Most cases invalidating or 
criticizing release-dismissal agree­
ments involve crimes against the 
police offenses.29 Although agree­
ments may be enforced in cases in 
which the criminal charges involve 

" Release-dismissal 
agreements can 

provide a valuable 
added protection 

against civil lawsuits .... 

" police conduct, courts will closely 
review such agreements to ensure 
there was no governmental over­
reaching or an attempt to sweep po­
lice misconduct under the rug. 

CONCLUSION 
The hypothetical pornography 

investigation discussed at the begin­
ning of this article would be an ap­
propriate case for the use of a re­
lease-dismissal agreement. The 
prosecutor has legitimate public in­
terest concerns for not bringing a 
criminal case against the store 
owner. Primarily, prosecution poli­
cies have changed, and the 
prosecutor's office does not have 
the time or resources to prosecute 
such cases. 

The store owner would be re­
quired to relinquish a civil suit but 
would benefit by the dismissal of 
the criminal charges. This win-win 
proposition for both sides spares the 
court unnecessary litigation. How­
ever, to ensure enforceability, the 

pornography store owner should be 
represented by counsel during the 
negotiations and should not be co­
erced into making the agreement. 

Courts uphold release-dis­
missal agreements if they are volun­
tarily entered into, there is no evi­
dence of prosecutorial misconduct 
or overreaching, and they are not 
against the public interest. Release­
dismissal agreements can provide a 
valuable added protection against 
civil lawsuits and should be consid­
ered any time the prosecutor decides 
the public interest is served by not 
prosecuting a case. 

Officers should remember three 
basic principles regarding release­
dismissal agreements. First, offi­
cers should always ensure that the 
prosecutor negotiates and enters 
into the agreement. Second, where 
possible, court approval or judicial 
supervision of the agreement should 
be obtained. Third, agreements 
may not be appropriate in cases 
where the criminal charges involve 
a crime against the police and it 
might be alleged that the govern­
ment is attempting to cover up po­
lice misconduct. .. 
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Cir. 1981) and Bushnell v. Rossetti, 750 F.2d 
298 (4th Cir. 1984) (upholding release-dismissal 
agreements) and Boyd v. Adams, 513 F.2d 83 
(7th Cir. 1975) and Dixon v. District of 
Columbia, 394 F.2d 966 (D.C. Cir. 1968) 
(declaring release-dismissal agreements 
invalid). 

2480 U.S. 386 (1987). 
3Id. at 389-392. 
4Id. at 395-396. 
5Id. at 396. 
6Id. at 394-395. 
7Id. at 398. 
8Id. at 393. 
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27 See Lynch v. City of Alhambra, 880 F.2d 
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Law enforcement officers of other 
than Federal jurisdiction who are 
interested in this article should consult 
their legal advisor. Some police 
procedures ruled permissible under 
Federal constitutional law are of 
questionable legality under State law 
or are not permitted at all. 
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