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The 8'ank Robbery 

At 10:15 a.m. on Thursday, August 
23, 1973, the quiet early routine of the 
Sveriges Kreditbank in Stockholm, 
Sweden, was destroyed by the chatter 
of a subrnachinegun. As clouds of 
plaster and glass settled around the 60 
stunned occupants, a heavily armed, 
lone gunman caned out in English, 
"The party has just begun." 1 

The "party" was to continue for 
131 hours, permanently affecting the 
lives of four young hostages and giving 
birth to a psychological phenomenon 
subsequently called the Stockholm 
Syndrome. 

During the 131 hours from 10:15 
a.m. on August 23 until 9:00 p.m. on 
August 28, four employees of the Sver­
iges Kreditbank were held hostage. 
They were: Elisabeth, age 21, then an 
employee of 14 months working as a 
cashier in foreign exchange, now a 
nurse; Kristin, age 23, then a bank 
stenographer in the loan department, 
today a social worker; Brigitta, age 31, 
an employee of the bank; and Sven, 
age 25, a new employee, today em­
ployed by the national government. 2 

They were held by a 32-year-Old con­
victed thief, burglar, and prison 
escapee named Jan-Erik 0lsson. 3 

Their jail was an 11- x 47-foot carpeted 
bank vault which they came to share 
with another convicted criminal and 
former cell mate of Olsson, Clark Olofs­
son, age 26. Olofsson joined the group 
only after Olsson demanded his re­
lease from Norrkoping Penitentiary. 4 
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This particular hostage situation 
gained long-lasting notoriety primarily 
because the electronic media exploited 
the fears of the victims, as well as the 
sequence of events. Contrary to what 
had been expected, it was found that 
victims feared the police more than 
they feared the robbers. In a telephone 
call to Prime Minister Olaf Pal me, one 
of the hostages expressed these typi­
cal feelings of the group when she 
said, "The robbers are protecting us 
from the police." Upon release other 
hostages puzzled over their feelings, 
"Why don't we hate the robbers."5 

For weeks after this incident, and 
while under the care of psychiatrists, 
some of the hostages experienced the 
paradox of nightmares over the possi­
ble escape of the jailed subjects and 
yet felt no hatred for these abductors. 
In fact, they felt the subjects had given 
them their lives back and were emo­
tionally indebted to them for their 
generosity. 

The Phenomenon 
The Stockholm Syndrome seems 

to be an automatic, probably uncon­
scious, emotional response to the trau­
ma of becoming a victim. Thou'gh 
some victims may think it through, this 
is not a rational choice by a victim who 
decides consciously that the most ad­
vantageous behavior in this predica­
ment is to befriend his captor. This 
syndrome has been observed around 
the world and includes a high level of 
stress as participants are cast together 
in a life-threatening environment where 
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each must achieve new levels of adap­
tation or regress to an earlier stage of 
ego development to stay alive_ This 
phenomenon, this positive bond, af­
fects the hostages and the hostage­
taker. This positive emotional bond, 
born in, or perhaps because of, the 
stress of the siege environment, 
serves to unite its victims against "out­
siders." A philosophy of "it's us against 
them" seems to develop. To date 
there is no evidence to indicate how 
long the syndrome lasts, Like the auto­
matic reflex action of the knee, this 
bond seems to be beyond the control 
of the victim and the subject. 

One definition of the Stockholm 
Syndrome takes into account three 
phases of the E:!xperience and de­
scribes it as: 

The positive feelings of the cap­
tives toward their captor(s) that are 
accompanied by negative feelings to­
ward the po/ice. These feelings are 
frequently reciprocated by the cap­
torrs). To achieve a successful resolu­
tion of a hostage situation, law 
enforcement must encourage and tol­
erate the first two phases so as to 
induce the thIrd and thus preserve the 
lives of all participants. G 

Though this relationship is new in 
the experience of law enforcement offi­
cers, the psychological community has 
long been aware of the use of an 
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emotional bond as a coping mecha­
nism of the ego under stress. 

Many years ago Sigmund Freud 
forged the theory of personality and 
conceived three major systems, calling 
them the id, the ego, and the 
superego. 

The id is man's expression of in· 
stinctual drive without regard to reality 
or morality. It contains the drive foi' 
preservation and destruction, as well 
as the appetite for pleasure. 7 

In the weI/-adjusted person the 
ego is the executive of the personality, 
controlling and governing the id and 
the superego and maintaining com­
merce with the external world in the 
interest of the total personality and its 
far-flung needs. When the ego is per­
forming its executive functions wisely, 
harmony and adjustment prevail in­
stead of the pleasure prinCiple, the ego 
is governed by the rea/iCy principle. 8 

The superego dictates to the ego 
how th& demands of !/Je id are to be 
satisfied It is in effect the conscience 
and is. usually developed by internaliza­
tion of parental ideals and prohibitions 
formed during early childhood 9 

Coping with reality is one function 
of the ego. The ego in the healthy 
personality is dynamic and resourceful. 
One of its functions is the use of de­
fense mechanisms, a concept devel­
oped by Sigmund Freud in 1894 when 
he wrote "The Neuro-Psychoses of 
Defense." Freud conceived the de­
fense mechanisms as the ego's strug­
gle against painful or unendurable 
ideas or their effects.lo Since Freud. 
the defense mechanisms have been 
discussed, explained, examined, and 
defined repeatedly. They vary in num­
ber depending upon the author. How­
ever, they all serve the same 
purpose-to protect the self from hurt 
and disorganization. 11 

When the self is threatened, the 
ego must cope with a great deal of 
stress. The ego enables the personal­
ity to continue to function even during 
the most painful experiences, sucl'! as 
being taken hostage by an armed, anx-
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ious stranger. The hostage wants to 
survive, and the healthy ego is seeking 
a means to achieve survival. 12 One 
avenue open is the use of defense 
mechanisms. The mechanism used 
most frequently by hostages inter­
viewed by the author has been regres­
sion. which Norman Cameron defines 
as a return to a less mature, less realis­
tic level of experience and behavior. 13 

Several theories have been advanced 
in an attempt to explain the observable . 
symptoms that law enforcement and 
members of the psychiatric community 

"The Stockholm 
Syndrome seems to 

be an automatic, 
probably unconscioUls, 
emotional response to 

the trauma of 
becoming a victim." 

have come to call the Stockholm Syn­
drome. 

In her book, The Ego and Its 
Mec/Janisms of Defense, Anna Freud 
discusses the phenomenon of identifi· 
cation with the aggressor. This version 
of identification is called upon by the 
ego to protect itself against authority 
figures who have generated anxiety.14 
The purpose of this type of identifica· 
tion is to enable the ego to avoid the 
wrath. the potential punishment, of the 
enemy. The hostage identifies out of 
fear rather than out of love. 15 It would 
appear that the healthy ego evaluates 
the situation and elects from its arsenal 
of defenses that mechanism which 
best served it in the past when faced 
with trauma. The normal developing 
personality makes effective use of the 
defense mechanism of identification, 
generally oLlt of love, when modeling 
itself after a parent. 

Identification often takes place in 
imitative learning. as when a boy identi· 
fies with his father and uses him as a 
model. 16 Some authors have called this 

type of identification introjection and 
use the Nazi concentration camps as 
an example of people radically altering 
their norms and values.l't 

According to James C. Coleman in 
his book, Abnormal Psychology and 
Modern Life, 

Introduction is closely related to 
identification. As a defense reaction it 
involves the acceptance of others' 
VALUES AND NORMS as one's own 
even when they are contrary to one's 
previous assumptions. 18 

Coleman goes on to discuss the 
common occurrence of people adopt­
ing the values and beliefs of a new 
government to avoid social retaliation 
and punishment. This reaction seems 
to follow the principle, "If you cafl"t 
beat 'em, join 'em." 19 

Though identification with the ag­
gressor 1s an attractive explanation for 
the Stockholm Syndrome, and may in­
deed be a factor in some hostage situ­
ations, it is not a total explanation for 
the phenomenon. This reaction is com­
monly seen in children at about the 
age of 5 as they begin to develop a 
conscience and have resolved the 
Oeqipal complex. They have given up 
the delusion of being an adult and now 
begin to work on the reality of growing 
up. This is usually done by identifying 
with the parent of the same sex and is 
generally healthy. However, when this 
parent is abusive, we see the identifi· 
cation serving the dual purpose of pro­
tection and as an ego ideal. 

The Stockholm Syndrome is 
viewed by this author as regression to 
a more elementary level of develop­
ment than is seen in the 5-year-old 
who identifies with a parent. The 5-
year-old is able to feed himself. speak 
for himself. and has locomoti()n. The 
hostage is more like the infant who 
must cry for food. cannot speak, and 
may be bound. Like the infant. the 
hostage is in a state of extreme depend­
ence and fright. He is. terrified of the 
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outside world, like the child who learns 
to walk and achieves physical separa­
tion be.fure he is ready for the emotion­
al separation from the parent. 

This infant is blessed with a 
mother figure who sees to his needs. 
As these needs are satisfactorily met 
by the mother figure, the child begins 
to love this person who is protecting 
him from the outside world. The adult is 
capable of caring and leading the in­
fant out of dependence and fear. So it 
is with the hostage-his extreme de­
pendence, his every breath a gift from 
the subject. He is now as dependent 
as he was as an infant-the control­
ling, all-powerful adult is again pres­
ent-the outside world is threatening 
once again. The weapons the police 
have deployed against the subject are 
also, in the mind of the hostage, de­
ployed against him. Once again he is 
dependent, perhaps on the brink of 
death. Once again there is a powerful 
guthority figure who can help. So the 
behavior that worked for the dep3nd­
ant infant surfaces again as a coping 
device, a defense mechanism, to lead 
the way to survival. 

Domestic Hostage Situations 
Since 1973, local law enforcement 

has been faced with many hostage 
situations. The subject-hostage bond is 
not always formed, yet case studies 
show that it is frequently a factor. As 
such, the Stockholm Syndrome should 
be kept in mind by police when they 
face such a situation, plan an attack, 
debrief former hostages, and cer­
tainly when the subjects are 
prosecuted. 

j-Iostage situations seem to be on 
the increase. Today more than ever, 
police are responding to armed robber­
ies in progress in a fraction of the time 
it required a few years ago. This in­
creased skill in incident response un­
fortunately promotes a perpetrator's 
need to take hostages. In the past, the 
armed robber was frequently gone be­
fore the employees felt safe enough to 
sound the alarm, but today silent 
alarms are triggered automatically. 
Computerized patrol practices place 
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police units in areas where they are 
more likely, statistically, to encounter 
an armed robbery. An analysis of past 
armed robberies dictates placement of 
patrol units to counter future attempts. 
Progress in one phase of law enforce­
ment has created new demands in 
another. 

The vast majority of hostage inci­
dents are accidental. In cases such as 
these, it is likely the robber did not plan 
to take hostages. However, the police 
arrived sooner than anticipated and as 
a new form of flight, a method of es­
cape, the now-trapped armed robber 
takes a hostage so l .. e can bargain his 
wayout. 

In his desperation the armed rob­
ber compounds his dilemma by adding 
kidnaping and assault charges. These 
considerations are initially minimal to 
him. His emotions are running high; he 
wants to buy time, and in this suc­
ceeds. Research has shown that the 
leader of the abductors usually has a 
prior felony arrest. 20 Therefore, though 
desperate, the hostage-taker is not ig­
norant or inexperienced in the ways of 
the criminal justice system and realizes 
the consequences of his new role. 

The trapped subject is outgunned 
and outnumbered, and with each fleet­
ing moment, his situation becomes 
less tenable. Perhaps he takes hos­
tages as a desperate offensive act, 
one of the few offensive acts available 
to him in his increasingly defensive 
position. Whatever his motivation, the 
subject is now linked with other individ­
uals, usually strangers, who will come 
to sympathize and in some cases em-· 
pathize with him in a manner now rec­
ognized and understood. 

The stranger-the victim-the 
law-abid:ng citizen-is forced into this 
life-and-death situation and is unpre­
pared for this turn of events. Suddenly 
his routine world is turned upside 
down. The police, who should help, 
seem equally helpless. The hostage 
may feel that the police have let him 
down by allowing this to happen. It all 
seems so unreal. 

Stages of Hostage Rleaction 

Many hostages ~:eek immediate 
psychological refuge in denial. Accord­
ing to Anna Freud, 

When we find denia/, we know that 
it is a reaction to external danger; 
when repression takes place, the ego 
is struggling with instinctual stimuli. 21 

Hostages, in interviews with this 
author, frequently discuss their use of 
denial of reality. The findings of denial 
are not limited: 

As I continued to talk to victims of 
violence, I became awam that the gen­
eral reactions of these victims were 
similar to the psychological response 
of an individual who experiences sud­
den and unexpected loss. Loss of any 
kind, particularly if sudden and unex­
pected, produces a certain sequence 
of response in all individuals. The first 
response is shock and denial 22 

Hostages have also repressed 
their feelings of fear. Frequently these 
feelings of fear are transferred from 
fear of the hostage-taker to fear of the 
police. Research has shown that most 
hostages die or are injured during the 
police assault phase. 23 This is not to 
say that the police kill them. 

Denial is a primitive, but an effec­
tive, psychological defense mecha­
nism. There are times when the mind is 
so overloaded with trauma that it can­
not handle the situation. 24 To survive, 
the mind reacts as if the traumatic 
incident is not happening. The victims 
respond: "Oh no;" "No, not me;" "This 
must be a dream;" "This is not happen­
ing." 25 These are all individually effec­
tive methods of dealing with 
excessively stressful situations. 

Denial is but one stage of coping 
with the impossible turn of events., 
Each victim who copes effectively has 
a strong will to survive. One may deal 
with the stress by believing he is 
dreaming and will soon wake up, and it 
will be all over. Some deaf with the 
stress by sleeping; this author has in­
terviewed hostages who have slept for 
over 48 hours while captive. Some 
have fainted, though this is rare. 
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Frequently hostages gradually' ac­
cept their situation, but find a safety 
valve in the thought that their fa.te is 
not fixed. They view their situation as 
temporary, sure that the police will 
come to their rescue. This gradual 
change from denial to delusions of re­
prieve reflects a growing acceptance 
of the facts. Although the victim ac­
cepts that he is a hostage, he believes 
freedom will come soon. 26 

If freedom does not immediately 
relieve the stress, many hostages be­
gin to engage in busy work, work they 
feel comfortable doing. Some knit, 
some methodically count and recount 
windows or other hostages, and some 
reflect upon their past life. This author 
has never interviewed a former hos­
tage who had not taken stock of his life 
and vowed to change for the better, an 
attempt to take advantage of a second 
chance at life. The vast majority of 
hostages share this sequence of emo­
tional events-denial, delusions of re­
prieve, busy work, and taking stock. 
The alliance that takes place between 
the hostage and the subject comes 
later. 

Time 

Time is a factor in the develop­
ment of the Stockholm Syndrome. Its 
passage can produce a positive or 
negative bond, depending on the inter­
action of the subjects and hostages. If 
the hostage-takers do not abuse their 
victims, hours spent together will most 
likely produce "positive" results. Time 
alone will not do so, but it may be the 
catalyst in nonabusive situations. 

In September 1976, when 5 Cro­
atian hijackers took a Boeing 727 car­
rying 95 people on a transatlantic flight 
from New York to Paris, another inci­
dent of the Stockholm Syndrome oc­
curred. Attitudes toward the hijackers 
and their crime reflected the varying 
exposures of those involved in the situ­
ation. 27 The hostages were released at 
intervals. The first group was released 
after a da;;, The debriefing of the vic­
tims in this situation has clearly 

8 I FBI Law Enforcement Bulletin 

indicated that the Stockholm Syn­
drome is not a magical phenomenon, 
but a logical outgrowth of positive hu­
man interaction. 

TWA flight 355, originally sched­
uled to fly from New York City to Tuc­
son, Ariz., via Chicago, on the eVdning 
of September 10, 1976, was diverted 
somewhere over western New York 
State to Montreal, Canada, where addi­
tional fuel was added. The hijackers 
then traveled to Gander, Newfound­
land, where 34 passengers deplaned 
to lighten the aircraft for its flight to 
Europe, via Keflavik, Iceland, with the 
remaining 54 passengers and a crew 
of 7. The subjects, primarily Julianna 
Eden Busic, selected passengers to 
deplane. She based her decision on 
age and family responsibilities. The re­
maining passengers, plus the crew of 
seven, were those who were single. 
married with no children, or those who 
had volunteered to remain on board, 
such as Bishop O'Rourke. After flying 
over London, the aircraft landed in 
Paris where it was surrounded by the 
police and not allowed to depart. After 
13 hours the subjects surrendered to 
French police. The episode lasted a 
total of 25 hours for most of the pas­
sengers and about 3 hours for those 
who deplaned at Gander. 28 

During the months of September 
and October of 1976, all but two of the 
hostages and all of the crew were 
interviewed. The initial hypothesis be­
fore the interviews was that those vic­
tims released after only a few hours 
would not express sympathy for the 
subjects, . while those released later 
would react positively toward the sub­
jects. In other words, time was viewed 
as the key factor. 

The hypothesis was not proven. 
Instead, it seemed the victims' atti­
tudes toward the subjects varied from 
subject to subject and from victim to 
victim, regardless of the amount of 
time they spent as captives. Although 
this seemed illogical, interviews with 
the victims revealed understandable 
reasons. It was learned that those vic­
tims who had negative contacts with 
the subjects did not evidence concern 
for them, regardless of time of release. 

Some of these victims had been phys­
ically abused by the subjects; they ob­
viously did not like their abusers and 
'ldvocated the maximum penalty be 
, )1posed. 

Other victims slept on and off for 2 
days. This could be a form of the de­
fense mechanism of denial, a desper­
ate ego-defensive means of coping 
with an otherwise intolerable event. 29 

These victims had minimal contact with 
the subjects and also advocated a 
maximum penalty. They may not have 
had distinctly negative contact, but 
they experienced no positive associ­
ation. Their only contact with the sub­
jects was on three occasions, when 
hostage-taker Mark Vlasic awakened 
them in Paris as he ordered all of the 
passengers into the center .of the air­
craft where he threatened to detonate 
the explosives unless the French gov­
ernment allowed them to depart. 

The other extreme was avidenced 
by victims, regardless of time of re­
lease, who felt great sympathy for their 
abductors. They had positive contact 
with the subjects, which included dis­
cussing the hijackers' cause and un­
derstanding their motivation and 
suffering. Some of these victims told 
the press that they were going to take 
vacation time to attend the trial. Others 
began a defense fund for their former 
captors. Some recommended defense 
counsel to the subjects, and others 
refustld to be interviewed by law en­
forcement officers who took the sub­
jects into custody. 30 

Perhaps one of the most self­
revealing descriptions of the Stock­
holm Syndrome was offered by one of 
these hijack victims: 

"After it was over and we were 
safe I recognized that they [the sub­
jG'cts] had put me through hell and had 
caused my parents and fiance a great 
deal of trauma. Yet, I was alive. I was 
alive because they had let me live. You 
know only a few people, if any, who 
hold your life in their hands and then 
give it back to you. After it was over, 
and we were safe and they were in 
handcuffs, I walked over to them and 
kissed each one and said, 'Thank you 
for giving me my life back. ' I know how 



foolish it sounds, but that is how I 
felt" 31 

Yet, this feeling of affection seems 
to be a mask for a great inner trauma. 
Most victims, including those who felt 
considerable affection for the subjects, 
reported nightmares. These dreams 
expressed the fear of the subjects es­
caping from custody and recapturing 

• them. 32 Dr. Ochberg reports similar 
findings,33 as did the psychiatrist in 
Stockholm in 1973. 34 

Again the hostages aboard the 
plane developed a personal relation­
ship with the cdminals. The feelings of 
one hostage were expressed when 
she said, "They didn't have anything 
[the bombs were fakes], but they were 
reatly great guys. I really want to go to 
their trial." 35 This is a very different 
view from that of New York City Police 
Commissioner Michael Codd, who said 
in an interview, "What we have here is 
the work of madm~n-murderers." 
The interview of the commissioner fol­
lowed an attempt to defuse a bomb left 

by the hijackers; the bomb killed one 
officer and seriously injured three 
others.36 

The situation in 1973 in Stockholm 
is not unique. These same feelings 
were generated in the Croatian aircraft 
hijacking, and more recently the Japa­
nese Red Army hijacking of JAL flight 
472 in September/October 1977,37 
and also in the hostage situation that 
took place at the German Consulate in 
August of 1978.38 

Isolation 

But the Stockholm Syndrome rela­
tionship does not alwCi/s develop. Sir 
Geoffry Jackson, the British Ambassa­
dor to Uruguay, was abducted and held 
by Tupamaro terrorists for 244 days. 
He remained in thought and actions 
the ambassador, the Qlleen's repre­
sentative, and so impressed his cap­
tors with his dignity that they were 
forced to change regularly his guards 
and isolate him for fear he might con-

vince them that his cause was just and 
theirs foolish. 39 Others, such as the 
American agronomist Dr. Claude Fly, 
held by the Tupamaros for 208 days in 
1970, have also avoided identification 
with the abductor or his cause. 40 He 
accomplished this by writing a 600-
page autobiography and by developing 
a 50-page "Christian checklist," in 
which he was able to create his own 
world and insulate himself against the 
hostile pressures around him.41 

According to Brooks McClure, 
In the case of both Dr. F.~v and Sir 

Geoffry Jackson, and other hostages 
as we/I, the terrorist organization found 
it necessary to remove the guards who 
were falling under their influence. 42 

In most situations, the Stockholm Syn­
drome is a two-way street. 

However, most victims of terrorist 
or criminal abductors are not individ­
uals of the status of Dr. Fly or Ambas­
sador Jackson, and as such do not 
retain an aura of aloofness during their 
captivity. As yet, there is no identified 
personality type more inclined to the 
Stockholm Syndrome. The victims do 
share some common experiences, 
though. 

Positive Contact 

The primary experience that vic­
tims of the syndrome share is positive 
contact with the subject. The positive 
contact is generated by lack of nega­
tive experiences, i.e., beatings, rapes, 
or physical abuse, rather than an actu­
al positive act on the part of the abduc­
tors. The few injured hostages who 
have evidenced the syndrome have 
been able to rationalize their abuse. 
They have convinced themselves that 
the abductor's show of force was nec­
ensary to take control of the situation, 
that perhaps their resistance precipitat­
ed the abductor's force. Self-blame on 
the part of the victims is very evident in 
these situations. 

f 

I 

';' 

I. 

• I,' . 



" 

Stockholm . Syndrome victims 
shaw a second common experience. 
They sense and identify with the hu­
man quality of their captor. At times 
this quality is more imagined than real, 
as the victims of Fred Carrasco 
learned in Texas in August 1974.013 

On the afternoon of July 24, 1974, 
at the Texas Penitentiary in Huntsville, 
Fred Carrasco and 2 associates took 
approximately 70 hostages in the pris­
on library. In the course of the 11-day 
siege, most of the hostages were re­
leased. However, the drama was 
played out on the steps of the library 
between 9:30 and 10:00 on the night of 
August 3, 1974. It was during this time 
that Carrasco executed the remaining 
hostages. 44 This execution took place 
in spite of his letters of affection to 
other hostages who were released ear­
lier due to medical problems. 45 

Some hostages expressed sympa­
thy for Carrasco. 46 A Texas Ranger 
who was at the scene and subsequent-

. Iy spoke to victims stated to the author 
that there was evidence of the Stock­
holm Syndrome. 47 Though the hos­
tages' emotions did not reflect the 
depth of those in Sweden a year be­
fore, the hostages admitted affection­
ate feelings toward a person they 
thought they should hate. They saw 
their captor as a human being with 
problems similar to their own. Law en­
forcement has long recognized that the 
trapped armed robber believes he is a 
victim of the police. We now realize 
that the hostage tends to share his 
opinion. 

When a robber is caught in a bank 
by quick police response, his dilemma 
is clear. He wants out with the money 
and his life. The police are preventing 
his escape by their presence and are 
demanding his surrender. The hostage, 
an innocent 'customer or employee of 
the bank, is also inside. His dilemma is 
similar to that of the robber-he wants 
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to get out and cannot. He has seen the 
arrogant robber slowly become "a per­
son" with a problem just like his own. 
The police on the outside correctly 
perceive the freedom of the hostage 
as the prerogative of the robber. How­
ever, the hostages perceive that the 
police weapons are pointed at them; 
the threat of tear gas makes them 
uncomfortable. The police insistence 
of the surrender of the subject is also 
keeping them hostage. Hostages begin 
to develo~ the idea that, "If the police 
would go away, I could go home. If 

"The primary 
experience that 
victims of the 

syndrome share is 
positive contact with 

the subject,," 

they would let him go, I would be 
free," .. 8 and so the bond begins. 

Hostage-Taker Reaction 
As time passes and positive con­

tact between the hostage and hostage­
taker begins, the Stockholm Syndrome 
also begins to talte i~s effect upon the 
subject. This was evident at Entebbe in 
July 1976. At least one of the terrorists, 
one who had engaged in coO\'ersa­
tions with the hostages fror,l Air France 
flight 139: elected at the moment of 
the attack to shoot at the Israeli com­
mandos rather than execute hostages. 49 

A moving account of this relation­
ship is presented by Dr. Frank Ochberg 
as he recounts the experience of one 
hostage of the South Moluccans in 
December 1975. Mr. Gerard Vaders, a 
newspaper editor in his 50's, related 
his experience to Dr. Ochberg: 

liOn the second night they tied me 
again to be a living shield and left me in 
that position for seven hours. The one 
who. was most psychopathic kept tell­
ing me, 'Your time has come. Say your 

- ------- ---

prayers. ' They had selected me for the 
third execution. . . . In the morning 
when I knew I was going to be executed, 
I asked to talk to Prins [another hos­
tage] to give him a message to take to 
my family. I wanted to explain my fam­
ily situation. My foster child, whose 
parents had been killed, did not get 
along too well with my wife, and I had 
at that lime a crisis in my marriage just 
behind me. . ., There were other 
things, too. Somewhere I had the feel­
ing that I had failed as a human being. I 
explained all this and the terrorists in­
sisted on listening. "50 

When Mr. Vaders completed his 
conversation with Mr. Prins and an­
nounced his readiness to die, the 
South Moluccans said, "No, someone 
else goes first." 51 

Dr. Ochberg observed that· Mr. 
Vaders was no faceless symbol any­
more. He was human. In the presence 
of his executioners, he made the tran­
sition from a symbol to be executed to 
a human to be spared. Tragically, the 
Moluccans selected another passen­
ger, Mr. Bierling, led him away, and 
executed him before they had the op­
portunity to know him. 52 

Mr. Vaders goes on to explain his 
intrapsychic experience, his Stockholm 
Syndrome: 

"And you had to fight a certain 
feeling of compassion for the Moluc­
cans. I know this is not natural, but in 
some way they come over human. 
They gave us cigarettes. They gave us 
blankets. But we also realize that they 
were killers. You lty to suppress that in 
your consciousness. And I knew I was 
suppressing that I also knew that they 
were victims, too. In the long run they 
would be as much victims as we. Even 
more. You saw their morale crumbling. 
You experienced the disintegration of 
their personalities. The growing of de­
spair. Things dripping through their fin­
gers. You COUldn't help but feel a 
certain pity. For people at ti7e begin­
mi7g with egos like gods-impregnable, 
invincible-they end up small, desper­
ate, feeling that a/.l was in vain." 63 

Most people cannot inflict pain on 
another unless their victim remains de­
humanized. 54 When the subject and his 
hostages are locked together in a 



vault, a building, a train, or an airplane, 
a' process of humanization apparently 
does take place. When a person, a 

• hostage, can build empathy while 
maintaining dignity, he or she can 
lessen the aggression of a captor. 55 

• The exception to this is the subject 
who is antisocial, as Fred Carrasco 
demonstrated in August 1974. Fortu­
nately, the Fred Carrascos of the world 
are in a minority, and in most situations 
the Stockholm Syndrome is a two-way 
street. With the passage of time and 
occurrence of positive experiences, 
the victims' chances of survival in­
crease. However, isolation of the vic­
tims precludes the forming of this 
positive bond. 

In some hostage situations, the 
victims have been locked in another 
room, or they have been in the same 
room but have been hooded or tied, 

. gagged, and forced to face the wall 
away from the subject. 56 Consciously 
or unconsciously, the subject has de­
humanized his hostage, thereby mak­
ing it easier to kill him. A3 long as the 
hostage is isolated, time is not a factor. 
The Stockholm Syndrome will not be a 
force that may save the life of the 
victim. 

individualized Reactions 
Additionally, it has been observed 

that even though some of the hostages 
responded positively toward their cap­
tors, they did not necessarily evidence 
S~octllolm Syndrome reactions toward 
all of the subjects. It was learned, logi­
cally, that most of the victims reacted 
positively toward those subjects who 
had treated them, in the words of tile 
victims, "fairly." Those hostages who 
gave glowing accounts of the gentle­
menly conduct of some subjects did 
not generalize to all subjects. They 
evidenced dislike, even hatred, toward 
one hostage-taker who they called an 
animal. 

A hypothetical question was 
posed to determine the depth of vic­
tims' feelings toward their captors. 
Each former hostage was asked what 

he would do in the following situation: 
A person immediately recognizable as 
a law enforcement officer, armed with 
a shoulder weapon, orders him to lie 
down. At that same instant, one of his 
former captors would order him to 
stand up. When asked what he would 
do, his response varied according to 
the identity' of the captor giving the 
"order." If a captor who had treated 
him fairly, hypothetically yeiled, 
"Stand up," he would stand up. Con­
versely, if he thought it was the com-' 
mand of the subject who had verbally 
abused him, he would obey the law 
enforcemer1t officer. This would indi­
cate that the strength of the syndrome 
is considerable. Even in the face of an 
armed officer of the law, he would offer 
himself as a human shield for his ab­
ductor. As absurd as this may seem, 
such behavior has been observed by 
law enforcement officers throughout 
the world. 57 

Whether the incident is a bank 
robbery in Stockholm, Sweden, a hi­
jacking of an American aircraft over 
western New York, a kidnaping in 
South America, or an attempted prison 
break in Texas, there are behavioral 
similarities despite geographic and me· 
tivational differences. In each situation 
a relationship, a healthy relationship 
(healthy because those involved were 
alive to talk about it), seems to develop 
within people caught in circumstances 
beyond their control and not of their 
making, a relationship that reflects the 
use of ego defense mechanisms by the 
hostage. This relationship seems to 
help victims cope with excessive 
stress, and at the same time, enables 
them to survive-a little worse for 
wear, but alive. The Stockholm Syn­
drome is not a magical relationship of 
blanket affection for tile subject. This 
bond, though strong, does have its 
limits-logical limits. If a person is nice 
to another, a positive feeling toward 
this person develops, even if this per­
son is an armed robber, a hijacker of 
an aircraft, a kidnaper, or a prisoner 
attempting to escape. 

The victim's need to survive is 
stronger than his impulse to hate the 
person who has 'created his dilemma. It 

is his abiiity to survive, to cope, that 
has enabled man to survive and claw 
his way to the top of the evolutionary 
ladder. His ego is functioning and has 
functioned well and has performed its 
primary task of enabling the self to 
survive. At· an unconscious level, the 
ego has activated the proper defense 
, mechanisms in the:::orrect sequence­
denial, regression, identification, or in­
trojection to achieve survival. The 
Stockholm Syndrome is just another 
e?<ample of the ability of the ego, the . 
healthy ego, to cope and adjust to 
difficult stress brought about by a trau­
matic situation. 

The application for law enforce­
ment is clear, though it does involve a 
trade-off. The priority in dealing with 
hostage situations is the survival of all 
participants-hostage, tht) crowd that 
has gathered, the police ol~icers, and 
the subject. To accomplish this end, 
various police procedures have been 
instituted. Inner and outer perimeters 
are longstanding procedures designed 
to keep crowds at a safe distance. 
Police training, discipline, and proper 
equipment save officers' lives. The de­
velopment of the Stockholm Syndrome 
may save the life of the hostage as 
well as the subject. The life of the 
subject is preserved, as it is highly 
unlikely that deadly force will be used 
by the police unless the subject makes 
a precipitous move. The life of the 
hostage may also be saved by the 
Stockholm Syndrome, the experience 
of positive contact, thus setting the 
stage for regression, identification, and/ 
or introjection. The subject is less likely 
to injure a hostage he has come to 
know and on occasion to love.58 

It is suggested that the Stockholm 
Syndrome can be fostered while nego­
tiating with the subject: By asking him 
to allow the hostage to talk on the 
telephone; asking him to check on the 
health of a hostage; or discussing with 
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him the family responsibilities of the 
hostage. Any action the negotiator 
can take to emphasize the hostage's 
human qualities to the subject should 
be considered by the negotiator. 

The police negotiator r.1ust pay a 
personal price for this induced relation­
ship. Hostages will curse him as they 
did in Stockholm in August 1973. They 
will call the police cowards and actively 
side with the subject in trying to 
achieve a solution. to . their plight, a 
solution not necessarily in their best 
interests or in the best interest of the 
community. 

Unfortunately, it may not end 
there. Victims of the Stockholm Syn­
drome may remain hostile toward the 
police after the siege has ended. The 
"original" victims in Stockholm still visit 
their abductors, and one former hos­
tage is engaged to Olofsson. 59 Some 
American victims visit their former cap­
tors in jail. 60 Others have begun de­
fense funds for them.61 A hostile 
hostage is a price that law enforce­
ment must pay for a living hostage. 
Antilaw enforcement feelings are not 
new to the police. But this may be the 
first time it has been suggested that 
law enforcement seek to encourage 
hostility, hostility from people whose 
lives law enforcement has mustered its 
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resources to save. However, a human 
life is an irreplaceable treasure and 
worth some hostility. A poor or hostile 
witness for the prosecution is a small 
price to pay for this life. FBI 
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